INVITATION TO BID #17113 SAE Customs Havey Communications Lund Industries Chicago Parts and Sound CDS Ray O'Herron
Police Vehicle Accessories
BID OPENING DATE: 5/25/2017
Group |DESCRIPTION Bid Total |Bid Total |Bid Total |Bid Total |Bid Total |Bid Total
A Police Vehicle Accessories for 2017 Ford Interceptor $205,934.41 $93,839.20 $218,907.00 $178,204.52 $28,216.50 $169,868.92
2. Installation & Delivery Costs Vehicle Type
B Total Installation Costs for Police  |Ford Interceptor $1150 / Vehicle No Bid $2,475.00 $1,850.00 No Bid No Bid
Vehicle Accessories
C Delivery Costs to Lake County DOT |All $50 / Vehicle No Bid $1,040.00 $2,340.00 No Bid No Bid
3. Discount # Of Vehicles Discount | # Of Vehicles Discount | # Of Vehicles Discount | # Of Vehicles Discount | # Of Vehicles Discount | # Of Vehicles Discount
D |Insta|lation Discount for Multiple Vehicles 6-10 5%, 11-15 10%, 16+ 15% |No Bid 112%,215% No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ultra Strobe Public Safety Fleet
Group |DESCRIPTION Bid Total |Bid Total
A Police Vehicle Accessories for 2017 Ford Interceptor $185,153.00 $202,332.00
2. Installation & Delivery Costs Vehicle Type
B Total Installation Costs for Police  |Ford Interceptor $50,700.00 $46,670.00
Vehicle Accessories
C Delivery Costs to Lake County DOT |All $0.00 $0.00
3. Discount # Of Vehicles Discount | # Of Vehicles Discount
D |Insta|lation Discount for Multiple Vehicles 50 2%, 75 3%, 100 5% No Bid
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